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Dear
Request for Information: Freedom of Information Act

Thank you for your email of 16" January making a request for information under the Freedom
of Information Act. You requested the following information and the Trust is able to provide
the information below in response:

Request:
If possible could | request two separate things here? | can send another email if needed

Firstly id like to find out the effectiveness of complex needs specifically in regard to
borderline personality disorder/ emotionally unstable personality disorder, all subtypes

How many patients under oxford health NHS foundation trust have a diagnosis of personality
disorder

1) How many clients are under a community mental health team covered by oxford health
2) out of these clients, how many as a percentage have a personality disorder diagnosis

3) how many clients diagnosed with borderline personality disorder attend complex
needs (as a number and a % of all diagnosed cases)

4) out of the clients who attend complex needs how many as a % are discharged without
the need for a referral (as a % and whole number)

5) out of the clients who attend complex needs how many as a % relapse wihin the first
year as a % and whole number

all of the above relate to borderline personality disorder and its variations please



my second piece of information is in regards to finance operations and I'm looking specifically
for oxford healths budget and expenditure for Buckinghamshire specifically and a breakdown
of that . similar to a budget plan document . would that be possible

Response:

720 (This figures is for all patients who have a current referral to Oxford Health (excluding
Inpatients) AND have a current diagnosis of Personality Disorder (including all subtypes).

1. 26694 (This figure is for all patients who have a current referral to Oxford Health
(excluding Inpatients))

2. 2.7%
3 Number: 196, Percentage: 27.2%

(These figures are for all patients who have a current personality disorder diagnosis AND a
current referral to a Complex Need Team AND have at least one attended appointment. Any
patient who has a current personality disorder AND a current referral but has not attended
any appointment is not included as the question stated ‘attend complex needs’.)

4 The Trust does not hold information in relation to this element of your request.
5 The Trust does not hold information in relation to this element of your request.

The Trust are unable to comply with elements 4 and 5 of your request without exceeding the
appropriate limit set in regulation by section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act. A manual
review of records would be required to derive the information requested, which the Trust
estimate could take a minimum of 50 hours to complete. The appropriate limit is 18 hours.

Oxford Health publish information in relation to its Annual Accounts on the Trust website, the
accounts for 2017/2018 can be accessed via the following URL:

https://www.oxfordhealth.nhs.uk/wp-content/uploads/2017/04/Annual-Report-and-
Accounts FINAL.pdf

The Annual Accounts for 2018/2019 are for future publication, before September 2019, and
the Trust has applied section 22 of the Freedom of Information Act to this element of your
request.

If you are concerned with the service you have received in relation to your request and wish to
make a complaint or request a review of our decision, you should write to me and | will ensure
the decision is reviewed. The Trust will consider undertaking a review if requested to do so
within 40 working days of the date the response is received by the applicant, and will apply
discretion if a longer period of time has passed.

Should you wish to make a complaint as a result of the outcome of such a review, you may
apply directly to the Information Commissioner's Office (ICO) for a decision.


https://www.oxfordhealth.nhs.uk/wp-content/uploads/2017/04/Annual-Report-and-Accounts_FINAL.pdf
https://www.oxfordhealth.nhs.uk/wp-content/uploads/2017/04/Annual-Report-and-Accounts_FINAL.pdf

Generally, the ICO cannot make a decision unless you have exhausted the complaints
procedure provided by the Trust for Fol Act matters.

The ICO can be contacted at:

The Information Commissioner's Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9
S5AF

Please contact me if there are any further queries.

Kind regards,

Yours sincerely,

Mark Underwood

Head of Information Governance



